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DESCRIPTION
Small molecule products and metabolic pathways that are 
involved in ecological interactions but are not absolutely 
necessary for the organism's survival are referred to as "secondary 
metabolism." These molecules are occasionally produced by 
specialized cells, such as plant latecomers. Secondary metabolites 
frequently act as mediators for mutualistic and antagonistic 
interactions, such as resource mutualisms and pollination 
mutualisms. Secondary metabolites include odors, colors, and 
antibiotics. The opposite of secondary metabolites are primary 
metabolites, which are thought to be necessary for an organism's 
normal growth or development. In the fields of pharmacology 
and molecular biology, a small molecule or macromolecule is an 
organic compound with a low molecular weight and a size of 
about 1 nm that has the potential to regulate a biological process.

In ecology, the effect that two organisms in a community have on 
one another is known as a biological interaction. They could be 
members of the same species or different species. The adaptation 
and evolution of the species is frequently significantly impacted 
by both short-term and long-term effects.

Because they live in crowded environments where chemical 
defense is preferable to physical escape, many animals, plants, 
fungi, and microbes produce secondary metabolites.

The intermediates and pathways of primary and secondary 
metabolism frequently overlap, making it difficult to distinguish 
the two. For instance, can serve sterols, which are secondary 
metabolism's byproducts and the building blocks of cells. A 
microbe or microorganism is a microscopic organism that can be 
a single cell or a colony of cells. Important secondary metabolites 
a substance that kills bacteria is an antibiotic. Because they are the

most important type of antibacterial agent, antibiotics are widely 
used in the treatment and prevention of bacterial infections. They 
might kill bacteria or prevent their growth. Antibiotics with 
antiprotozoal properties are extremely rare. Antibiotics cannot 
treat viruses like the common cold and influenza; Antiviral 
medications are those that stop viruses from growing, not 
antibiotics. Furthermore, they are useless against fungi; 
Medications that prevent fungi from growing are called 
antifungals. In addition, pigment is a colorless, water-insoluble 
substance that can dissolve completely or almost completely. In 
contrast, dyes are typically soluble, at least when used. In contrast 
to dyes, which typically contain organic compounds, pigments 
typically contain inorganic compounds. Past and ancient pigments 
include ochre, charcoal, and lapis lazuli.

An odor is caused by one or more volatilized chemical 
compounds, which are typically present in low concentrations 
and can be detected by humans and many animals' sense of 
smell. An odor's "smell" or "scent" can also be used to describe 
whether it's pleasant or unpleasant.

Streptomycin is an antibiotic that is used to treat, among other 
bacterial infections, rat bite fever, Mycobacterium avium 
complex, endocarditis, brucellosis, Burkholderia infection, 
plague, tularemia, and tuberculosis. For active tuberculosis, it is 
typically given with isoniazid, rifampicin, and pyrazinamide. It's 
injected into a muscle or vein.

Finally, although secondary metabolites do not directly 
contribute to metabolism, they are necessary under certain 
conditions. It's possible that the absence of secondary metabolites 
does not indicate a significant change in metabolism. Secondary 
metabolites are used in medicine, flavoring, and other 
applications.
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