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DESCRIPTION
Diabetes Mellitus (DM) is a widespread disease and a significant 
Cardiovascular (CV) risk factor. High serum fatty substance 
levels, high tiny thick Low-Density Lipoprotein (LDL) levels, 
High-Density Lipoprotein (HDL) levels, and postprandial lipemia 
are characteristics of atherogenic dyslipidemia in diabetes. 
Obstruction of insulin is a key factor in Attention Deficit 
Disorder (ADD). Although statins are incredibly effective at 
preventing Cardiovascular Disease (CVD) in those with diabetes, 
even with the best statin therapy, a significant residual 
Cardiovascular risk remains. In addition to statins, fibrates, 
niacin, and omega-3 unsaturated fats are used to treat Attention 
Deficit Disorder (ADD) (explicitly hypertriglyceridemia). These 
drugs are far from being the ideal complement to statins because 
they have a number of limitations. There are many newer drugs 
in development for ADD executives. Double Peroxisome 
Proliferator-Activated Receptors (PPAR) agonists are in the most 
advanced stage of clinical development and have an objective 
technique because they regulate both ADD and blood glucose 
levels (by reducing insulin resistance, a key role in ADD). The 
availability of double PPAR / agnostics and other drugs for ADD 
may one day improve cardiovascular outcomes and lessen 
mortality and gloom in diabetic patients.

Diabetes Mellitus (DM) is a global scourge and a major cause of 
morbidity and mortality. The International Diabetes Federation 
(IDF) estimates that 366 million people have Diabetes Mellitus 
(DM) in the world in 2011; by 2030, this figure will rise to 552 
million. India, a highly populous nation, also has a sizable 
population who suffers from DM. According to estimated stage I 
results from the Indian Council of Medical Research-India 
Diabetes (ICMR-INDIAB) project, there are 62.4 million 
diabetics and 77.2 million pre-diabetics in India.

Atherogenic dyslipidemia, which is characterized by elevated 
levels of tiny thick LDL (sdLDL), elevated levels of fatty acids 
(TGs), and decreased levels of HDL cholesterol, is the most well-
known instance of dyslipidemia in type 2 diabetic patients. 
'Atherosclerogenic dyslipidemia' or the 'Atherosclerogenic 
Lipoprotein Aggregate', which includes a higher extent of sdLDL

particles, decreased HDL-C, and expanded TGs, was first 
described by Austin et al., in 1990. Patients with obesity, the 
metabolic disease, insulin resistance, and T2DM naturally have 
atherogenic dyslipidemia, which has emerged as a critical marker 
for the increased CVD risk seen in these populations. The main 
factor contributing to the worsening of Attention Deficit 
Disorder ADD in people with T2DM is insulin resistance (IR). 
Expanded arrival of free unsaturated fats into the course is 
caused by IR at the adipocyte. Similar accumulations of 
unsaturated fats might result from mutations in proteins that act 
as intracellular restriction agents or unsaturated fat transporters.

Increased FFA transport to the liver stimulates the production 
and release of Very Low Density Lipoprotein (VLDL), which 
results in hypertriglyceridemia. Therefore, the underlying lipid 
abnormalities causing others in ADD, hypertriglyceridemia. 
Numerous tests have demonstrated the high prevalence of 
hypertriglyceridemia in T2DM. Individual epidemiologic studies 
have produced varying results regarding the strength of the 
association between hypertriglyceridemia and coronary heart 
disease, particularly after accounting for risk factors like insulin 
resistance and low HDL-C levels, both of which are symptoms of 
Attention Deficit Disorder (ADD). Statins are frequently used to 
lower cholesterol levels because CVD is a risk for executives. 
Regardless of the patient's lipid profile, statins are recommended 
for all diabetics with CVD and are an essential CVD prevention 
strategy for those over 40 with one or more other CV risk factors 
(hypertension, albuminuria, etc.). 30 Statins also reduce TG 
levels and somewhat raise HDL.

Despite the fact that statins are quite helpful in reducing CV risk 
in diabetic patients, there is still a significant mortality problem. 
Numerous other risk factors, such as ADD, can serve as an 
example of such. A key abnormality of ADD in diabetic people is 
hypertriglyceridemia. Additionally, increased CV risk in diabetes 
patients is implied. Currently, there are many treatments 
available for ADD. Newer options, such PPAR double agonists 
(such as saroglitazar), maintain the hope that enhancing the 
management of ADD may further increase diabetic patients' CV 
outcomes, potentially improving morbidity and mortality benefits 
in the future.
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