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Endometrial Cancer
In developed countries, endometrial cancer (EC) is the most

frequent cancer of the female reproductive system [1-4]. According to
the recent recommendations and guidelines, systematic surgical
staging represents the primary treatment of these patients [1-4].
However, the extent of this procedure should be carefully
individualized according to the histological type and the patient’s
general performance status [1-4].

Moreover, all these recommendations and guidelines emphasize the
fact that pelvic and para-aortic lymphadenectomy is really essential in
systematic surgical staging [1,3,4]. This is mostly because the
implementation of systematic lymphadenectomy provides meaningful
data regarding the necessity of postoperative treatment with a view to
increase the survival and at the same time diminish the morbidity of
overtreatment (e.g. side effects and toxicity related with radiotherapy
and chemotherapy) and the consequences of under-treatment
(recurrence) [1-4]. Nevertheless, in early stage type I EC patients, the
utilization of pelvic lymphadenectomy has no effect on the overall and
the disease free survival and should be avoided in daily practice [1-4].

Recently, sentinel lymph node mapping and dissection has gained
popularity in EC patients [4-7]. This is mainly because that specific
approach epitomizes an equilibrium between systematic and no
lymphadenectomy in well selected EC patients of low and intermediate
risk [1,4-10].

The rational of the sentinel lymph node mapping and dissection is
based on the fact that lymph follows a specific pattern to drain away
from the endometrial tumor [5,9]. In particular, we inject a tracer (99
m Technetium, patent blue, indocyanine green) directly into the uterus
(mainly into cervix, but also into the uterine serosa or endometrium)
and we identify the sentinel lymph nodes using specific equipment
[1,5,6,9,11]. Therefore based on the accumulation and the signal of the
injected agent, we are able to identify and dissect the suspicious for
metastasis lymph nodes [5-8,11].

According to the sentinel lymph node surgical algorithm, apart
from the sentinel we should also remove any suspicious or enlarged
lymph nodes [5]. Furthermore, if we cannot detect the sentinel lymph
node on one side, a side specific pelvic, common iliac and interiliac
systematic lymphadenectomy should be performed [5].

The dissected sentinel lymph nodes should be ultra-staged by the
pathologist [5,12]. This process requires multiple sections from every
lymph node combined with immunohistochemistry [5,12]. A lymph
node is considered positive when contains not only macrometastasis
but also micrometastasis or even isolated tumor cells [5]. In particular,

in macrometastasis there are tumor clusters more than 2 mm, while in
micrometastasis the tumor clusters are between 0.2 and 2.0 mm [5].
Nevertheless, ultra-staging is time consuming, expensive and
unsuitable for large numbers of lymph nodes [5,12].

In patients with negative sentinel lymph nodes, there is no need for
further node excision because of the low chance for distal node
involvement [5,9]. In this case, we could avoid any unnecessary
overtreatment by excising normal or negative lymph nodes [5,6].
Moreover, we could decrease the total operative time, the financial cost
and the incidence of perioperative complications (nerves or vessels
injury, formation of lymphocysts or lymphoedema and cellulitis)
compared with the systematic lympadenectomy [1-5].

On the other hand, in positive sentinel lymph nodes patients,
systematic pelvic and para-aortic lymphadenectomy is required [4,5,9].
In particular, we should remove the lymphatic tissue from the distal
half of the common iliac vessels, the external iliac vessels and the
obturator fossa, as well as from the inferior vena cava and aorta (up to
the level of the renal vessels or lower to the inferior mesenteric artery)
[1,3,4].

Particularly in patients with early stage endometrial carcinoma,
sentinel lymph node mapping could have a crucial role in the detection
of nodes micrometastases, according to the SENTI-ENDO study
results [1,5,6,9,11,13,14]. This is mainly due to the application of
ultrastaging in the dissected lymph nodes [7,8,14].

In conclusion, sentinel lymph node mapping and dissection
represents an interesting approach in well selected EC patients
[1,4,5,7-11]. Although in endometrial cancer, this approach is still
experimental, it could possibly have a prominent role in the lymph
node assessment, especially in early stages [1,5,6,9,11,13,14]. However,
prospective randomized clinical trials are necessary in order to clarify
whether this procedure could finally substitute the systematic
lymphadenectomy in the future [1,4,5,7,8,14].
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