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DESCRIPTION
Crohn’s disease is a chronic Inflammatory Bowel Disease (IBD) 
that affects the Gastrointestinal (GI) tract, leading to symptoms 
such as abdominal pain, diarrhea, weight loss, and fatigue. It is 
part of a broader category of autoimmune disorders, where the 
body's immune system mistakenly attacks its own tissues. The 
development of Crohn’s disease is centrally influenced by the 
immune system. In a healthy individual, the immune system is 
designed to protect the body from harmful invaders such as 
bacteria, viruses and other pathogens. However, in people with 
Crohn’s disease, the immune system malfunctions and starts 
attacking the healthy cells of the gastrointestinal tract.

The precise cause of this immune system dysfunction is not fully 
understood. However, it is believed that genetic factors, 
environmental triggers and an abnormal response to gut bacteria 
contribute to the immune system's overreaction. T-cells, a type of 
white blood cell, are involved in this process [1]. In Crohn’s 
disease, T-cells are overly activated and produce inflammatory 
cytokines, leading to the inflammation and damage of the 
intestinal lining [2]. This inflammation can result in the 
formation of ulcers, strictures, and sometimes fistulas, which 
complicate the disease. The body’s immune response to gut 
microbiota microorganisms living in the digestive tract also plays 
a significant role. In Crohn’s disease, the gut microbiome 
becomes imbalanced, which can further exacerbate 
inflammation [3]. This dysbiosis may contribute to the chronic 
nature of the disease and make it difficult to manage.

Sources of Crohn’s disease

While the exact cause of Crohn’s disease remains elusive, several 
factors contribute to its development:

Genetics: Family history plays an important role. Having a close 
relative with Crohn’s disease increases the likelihood of 
developing the condition. Certain gene mutations, such as those 
in the NOD2 gene, have been associated with an increased risk of 
developing IBD [4].

Environmental factors: Factors such as diet, smoking, and 
exposure to infections can increase the risk. For instance, 
smoking has been found to worsen the course of the disease and 
increase the likelihood of flare-ups [5]. Additionally, living in 
urban areas with higher levels of sanitation and hygiene has been 
linked to a higher incidence of Crohn’s disease, likely due to 
changes in the immune system’s ability to respond to microbial 
exposure [6].

Immune system dysfunction: As mentioned, Crohn’s disease is 
an autoimmune disorder, meaning that an abnormal immune 
response plays a pivotal role [7]. The body’s immune system 
mistakenly identifies harmless bacteria in the intestines as 
invaders and launches an inflammatory response.

Treatment options for Crohn’s disease

The treatment of Crohn’s disease aims to reduce inflammation, 
manage symptoms, and prevent flare-ups. While there is no cure, 
several therapies can help control the disease:

Anti-inflammatory drugs: These include corticosteroids and 
aminosalicylates, which help reduce inflammation in the gut.

Immunosuppressants: Drugs such as azathioprine and 
methotrexate help suppress the overactive immune response, 
reducing inflammation.

Biologic therapies: These target specific immune system 
proteins involved in inflammation, such as Tumor Necrosis 
Factor (TNF) inhibitors (e.g., infliximab and adalimumab).

Antibiotics: Infections and complications like abscesses and 
fistulas can be treated with antibiotics.

Surgical treatment: In some cases, when medications fail or 
complications arise, surgery may be necessary. This can involve 
removing damaged sections of the bowel or repairing fistulas.

Lifestyle and dietary changes: A modify diet plan can help 
manage symptoms and prevent flare-ups. Nutritional support, 
such as vitamin and mineral supplementation, may be required, 
particularly if nutrient absorption is impaired.
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includes immune-boosting foods can complement medical 
treatments and support overall health. By understanding the 
mechanisms of the disease and taking a proactive approach to 
treatment, individuals with Crohn’s disease can better manage 
their condition and live healthier lives.
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Immune-boosting foods for Crohn’s disease

While diet alone cannot cure Crohn’s disease, certain foods can 
help support the immune system and reduce inflammation [8]. 
An anti-inflammatory diet that emphasizes nutrient-dense, 
whole foods is essential for people with Crohn’s disease [9].

Omega-3 fatty acids: Found in fatty fish like salmon, mackerel 
and sardines, omega-3 fatty acids have strong anti-inflammatory 
properties that may help reduce the gut inflammation seen in 
Crohn’s disease.

Probiotics: Probiotics, such as those found in yogurt, kefir and 
fermented foods, can help restore a healthy balance of gut 
bacteria. This can potentially reduce inflammation and improve 
digestion, supporting immune function.

Fiber-rich foods: Although fiber may aggravate symptoms during 
a flare-up, high-fiber foods such as oats, chia seeds and lentils 
can be beneficial during remission. Fiber helps nourish the 
beneficial bacteria in the gut, promoting a healthy microbiome 
and boosting immune function [10].

Antioxidant-rich foods: Foods rich in antioxidants, such as 
fruits and vegetables (particularly leafy greens, berries and bell 
peppers), can help combat oxidative stress and support immune 
health. Vitamins A, C and E play an important role in reducing 
inflammation.

Turmeric: Curcumin, the active compound in turmeric, has 
powerful anti-inflammatory effects. Including turmeric in diet, 
either as a spice or in supplement form, may help reduce 
inflammation associated with Crohn’s disease.

Bone broth: Rich in collagen and amino acids like glutamine, 
bone broth can help heal the intestinal lining and reduce 
inflammation.

Crohn’s disease is a complex autoimmune disorder with a 
multifactorial origin, involving immune system dysfunction, 
genetic factors, and environmental triggers. While there is no 
cure for Crohn’s disease, treatments including medications, 
surgery and dietary modifications can help manage symptoms 
and improve quality of life. An anti-inflammatory diet that
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