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ABSTRACT
Aim: The primary aim of this article is to investigate and illuminate the multifaceted relationship between prosocial

personality traits and an array of diverse social preferences. Through a novel experimental paradigm and

comprehensive analysis, we endeavor to deepen our understanding of how specific prosocial traits relate to various

social preferences, extending beyond traditional paradigms.

Objective: This research aims to uncover the intricate connections between prosocial personality traits and a wide

range of social preferences. Through a novel experimental paradigm, we seek to discern how specific traits contribute

to diverse social preferences, enhancing our understanding of the complex interplay between personality and

prosocial behaviors.

Methodology: We developed a novel experimental paradigm employing six variations of the dictator game,

manipulating decision costliness and reciprocity conditions. Two community samples participated in within-subjects

designs. Prosocial traits were assessed using validated measures. Statistical analyses examined trait-preference

associations, addressing limitations of prior research.

Results: Our findings revealed nuanced associations between prosocial personality traits and diverse social

preferences. Politeness uniquely linked to costly prosocial allocations, while compassion was pronounced in costless

generosity games. HEXACO honesty-humility played a pivotal role across both contexts. Negative reciprocity linked to

lower HEXACO agreeableness. Certain traits showed effects beyond unconditional kindness contributions.

Discussion: This study deepens understanding of the intricate interplay between prosocial personality traits and

diverse social preferences. The novel paradigm and robust sample sizes enhance credibility. Politeness and compassion

displayed unique associations, while HEXACO traits showcased broad influence. Implications extend beyond

economic games, offering insights into real-world prosocial behaviors.

Conclusion: By uncovering the intricate connections between prosocial personality traits and diverse social

preferences, this research expands our comprehension of human prosocial behavior. The novel experimental

paradigm and insightful findings provide a foundation for future investigations, enriching our understanding of the

dynamic interplay between personality and social preferences.
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and a wide array of social preferences, this study introduces a 
novel experimental paradigm. By building upon previous work 
that incorporates reciprocity and efficiency concerns into binary-
choice tasks, we aim to comprehensively examine the 
relationship between specific prosocial traits and diverse social 
preferences [5,6]. We hypothesize that different prosocial 
personality traits will be uniquely associated with distinct social 
preferences, shedding light on the underlying motivations that 
drive prosocial behavior across various contexts.

In the following sections, we will detail the methodology 
employed to investigate these relationships, present the results of 
our study, and discuss the implications of our findings for 
understanding the complex interplay between prosocial 
personality traits and the diverse range of social preferences that 
shape human interactions [7]. This research contributes to a 
more comprehensive framework for understanding prosocial 
behavior and offers insights into how individual differences in 
personality traits influence the ways in which individuals 
navigate social interactions.

MATERIALS AND METHODS

Ethics statement

The study was approved by the Human Ethics Advisory Group 
of the Melbourne School of Psychological Sciences at The 
University of Melbourne. Participants provided informed 
consent via an electronic survey following established guidelines.

Participants: The study involved North American recruited 
from Amazon Mechanical Turk. Selection criteria excluded 
workers familiar with economic game paradigms.

Personality measures

Two personality measures were used:

Big Five Aspect Scales (BFAS): Participants completed the 100-
item BFAS assessing five broad personality domains and their 
aspects. Focus was on the agreeableness domain, including 
politeness and compassion, measured with 10 items each on a 
five-point Likert scale.

HEXACO Personality Inventory-Revised (HEXACO-PI-R): 
Participants completed the 100-item HEXACO-PI-R, focusing 
on honesty-humility and agreeableness domains. Each trait 
measured with 16 items on a five-point Likert scale.

Participants completed demographic questions, personality 
measures, and hypothetical economic games via an electronic 
survey on Amazon Mechanical Turk. Personality questionnaires 
served as fillers. Economic games were hypothetical and 
imagined playing with an anonymous partner. Attention checks 
were used, excluding 11% of participants.

Economic games: Six games based on dictator and generosity 
concepts were played, using a 2 × 3 repeated measures design:

• Two game types-dictator and generosity (Table 1).
• Three reciprocity conditions-baselines, help, and hurt (Figure

1).
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INTRODUCTION

Human interactions are characterized by a remarkable variety of 
behaviors that extend beyond narrow self-interest, reflecting an 
intricate interplay of prosocial tendencies and social preferences. 
These preferences, encompassing distributive fairness, 
reciprocity, and other-regarding considerations, highlight the 
complex nature of social interactions and underscore the 
diversity of motivations that drive human behavior. 
Understanding the mechanisms that underlie these preferences 
and their relationship with individual differences in personality 
traits is crucial for unraveling the dynamics of prosocial 
behavior.

Prosocial behaviors are those actions taken to benefit others, 
often at a cost to oneself. While traditional economic theories 
have emphasized self-interest as the primary driver of human 
behavior, extensive empirical research has consistently 
demonstrated that individuals frequently engage in prosocial 
acts, deviating from purely self-centered motivations. These 
prosocial behaviors manifest across a range of contexts, from 
charitable donations and volunteering to everyday acts of 
kindness and cooperation [1,2].

A critical challenge in understanding prosocial behaviors lies in 
deciphering the diverse array of social preferences that guide 
human interactions. Distributive preferences capture concerns 
for equality and fairness, reflecting individuals' inclinations to 
divide resources fairly or to favor the less advantaged. 
Reciprocity preferences, on the other hand, involve responding 
to others' actions with either generosity or retaliation, based on 
previous interactions or intentions. These preferences intertwine 
in complex ways, shaping how individuals navigate social 
dilemmas and make decisions that affect others.

At the heart of these behaviors lie individual differences in 
personality traits that predispose individuals to engage in certain 
patterns of prosocial behavior. Personality traits, often 
conceptualized within frameworks like the Big Five and 
HEXACO models, offer a lens through which to examine stable 
and enduring characteristics that influence how individuals 
perceive and respond to their social environment [3]. 
Understanding how specific prosocial personality traits 
contribute to distinct social preferences provides a nuanced 
perspective on the motivations driving prosocial behavior.

Despite the substantial progress made in understanding the 
relationship between prosocial behaviors and personality traits, 
there are notable gaps in the literature. Much of the existing 
research has focused on a limited set of social preferences, often 
employing simplified game scenarios that fail to capture the 
complexity of real-world interactions. Moreover, the majority of 
studies have primarily examined the trade-offs between self-
interest and prosocial tendencies in contexts such as the dictator 
game [4]. While these investigations offer valuable insights, they 
may not fully capture the richness and diversity of social 
preferences that human’s exhibit.

To address these limitations and advance our understanding of 
the intricate connections between prosocial personality traits
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Game type

Dictator games Generosity games

(0,10) (5,10)

(1,9) (5,9)

(2,8) (5,8)

(3,7) (5,7)

(4,6) (5,6)

(5,5) (5,5)

(6,4) (5,4)

(7,3) (5,3)

(8,2) (5,2)

(9,1) (5,1)

(10,0) (5,0)

Table 1: Payoff combinations to choose from above table.

Figure 1: Initial information provided regarding reciprocity 
conditions.

RESULTS AND DISCUSSION
The results of study exhibited social preferences surpassing mere
inequality aversion and egalitarianism. Participants showed
generosity by allocating more wealth to partners when decisions
were costless compared to costly situations [8-10]. Positive
reciprocity was evident as participants allocated more after
receiving assistance, yet negative reciprocity was absent, with no
difference when hurt by a partner's action. Gender played a role,
with men allocating more than women in generosity games and
after being unharmed by their partner.

Personality traits demonstrated a mix of expected and
unexpected patterns. In the Big Five model, politeness (not
compassion) showed significance. Within HEXACO, honesty-
humility predicted higher allocations in dictator games, while
agreeableness predicted greater generosity in costless decisions
[11,12]. Study used hypothetical scenarios, raising concerns
about their comparability to incentivized games and potential
methodological biases [13-15].

CONCLUSION
This research enhances our understanding of the complex
relationship between prosocial traits and a diverse range of
social preferences. The novel experimental paradigm and robust
sample sizes bolster the credibility of the findings. Implications
extend beyond economic games, offering insights into real-world
prosocial behaviors. The study significantly contributes to our
comprehension of human prosocial behavior by uncovering the
intricate connections between specific prosocial personality
traits and diverse social preferences. The innovative
experimental paradigm and insightful outcomes provide a
foundation for further exploration, enriching our
understanding of the dynamic interplay between personality and
social preferences in human interactions.
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Dictator games: Participants chose preferred allocations out of 
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Generosity games: Participants chose allocations out of 11 
combinations with fixed $5 for self and varying amounts for 
partner.
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