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DESCRIPTION
Hispanic/Latino individuals represent a diverse population with 
varying cultural backgrounds, linguistic diversity, and unique 
experiences. When it comes to alcohol and other drug 
dependence, it is important to acknowledge that these issues can 
manifest differently across different Hispanic/Latino subgroups. 
The similarities and differences in patterns of substance abuse 
and dependence among these subgroups are crucial for 
developing effective prevention and treatment strategies. This 
note will explore the similarities and differences in alcohol and 
other drug dependence among Hispanic/Latino subgroups. It 
includes similarities and differences.

Similarities

Cultural factors: Despite the diversity among Hispanic/Latino 
subgroups, there are some common cultural factors that 
contribute to alcohol and other drug dependence. Many 
Hispanic/Latino cultures have a tradition of socializing  
with alcohol, which can increase the risk of excessive drinking. 
The cultural value of machismo (male dominance) may also 
contribute to higher rates of alcohol and drug use among 
men as a way to prove their masculinity.

Acculturation stress: Hispanic/Latino individuals often face 
unique challenges during the process of acculturation, which can 
increase the risk of substance abuse. The stress associated with 
adapting to a new culture, language barriers, discrimination, and 
loss of cultural identity can contribute to the development of 
substance dependence across all subgroups.

Familial influence: Family plays a central role in Hispanic/
Latino culture, and family dynamics can impact substance abuse 
patterns. In many Hispanic/Latino subgroups, there is a higher 
prevalence of multigenerational households, where older family 
members may have more permissive attitudes towards alcohol 
and drug use. This can increase the risk of substance abuse 
among younger family members.

Differences
Country of origin: Hispanic/Latino subgroups come from 
various countries, such as Mexico, Puerto Rico, Cuba, the 
Dominican Republic, and others. Each subgroup has its own 
unique cultural practices, beliefs, and norms regarding alcohol 
and drug use. For example, alcohol consumption is more 
prevalent among Mexican Americans, while Puerto Ricans have 
higher rates of illicit drug use.

Language: Language plays a significant role in the acculturation 
process. Hispanic/Latino subgroups may differ in their 
proficiency in English and Spanish, and this can influence 
substance abuse patterns. Individuals who are more proficient in 
English may have greater exposure to American culture, 
including higher rates of substance abuse.

Socioeconomic factors: Socioeconomic factors can vary among 
Hispanic/Latino subgroups, influencing the prevalence and 
consequences of substance abuse. Some subgroups may face 
higher levels of poverty, limited access to healthcare, and 
educational disparities, which can contribute to higher rates of 
substance abuse and dependence.

Immigration status: Differences in immigration status can 
impact substance abuse patterns among Hispanic/Latino 
subgroups. Undocumented immigrants may face additional 
stressors such as fear of deportation, limited access to healthcare, 
and social isolation, which can increase the risk of substance 
abuse and dependence.

Treatment utilization: Hispanic/Latino subgroups may differ in 
their rates of seeking and utilizing substance abuse treatment. 
Cultural beliefs, language barriers, lack of health insurance, and 
stigma can act as barriers to treatment access and utilization. 
Some subgroups may have lower rates of treatment seeking due 
to these factors.

CONCLUSION
Similarities and differences in alcohol and other drug
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dependence among Hispanic/Latino subgroups are crucial for 



the unique characteristics and  experiences of each subgroup.  By 
acknowledging these differences the interventions accordingly, 
healthcare providers and policymakers can effectively address 
alcohol and drug dependence in the Hispanic/Latino subgroups.
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developing targeted prevention and treatment interventions. 
While there are common cultural factors and challenges faced 
by all Hispanic/Latino subgroups, it is important to recognize 
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