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ABOUT THE STUDY
Domestic violence, also known as intimate partner violence or 
family violence, is a pervasive and distressing issue that affects 
millions of people worldwide.

It transcends geographical, cultural, and socioeconomic boundaries, 
leaving a trail of physical, emotional, and psychological scars.

Factors

Domestic violence encompasses a range of abusive behaviours 
that occur within intimate relationships, including physical 
violence, sexual abuse, emotional abuse, and financial 
manipulation. It often thrives in an environment of power and 
control, where one partner seeks to dominate and exert authority 
over the other. This dynamic can be fuelled by various factors:

Social norms and patriarchy: Societal norms that perpetuate 
gender inequalities and reinforce traditional gender roles can 
contribute to the perpetuation of domestic violence.

Cycle of abuse: The cycle of abuse often includes a tension-
building phase, an acute abusive incident, and a honeymoon 
phase, making it difficult for victims to break free from the 
abusive relationship.

Victims

Domestic violence doesn't discriminate. It affects individuals of 
all genders, ages, races, religions, and socioeconomic 
backgrounds. However, women are disproportionately affected, 
with statistics showing that they are more likely to experience 
severe forms of abuse.

Women as victims: Women are more frequently subjected to 
physical violence, sexual assault, and emotional abuse. The 
reasons behind this disparity are complex and rooted in social 
and cultural factors.

Children as witnesses: Children growing up in homes with 
domestic violence often suffer severe emotional trauma, and 
they may develop behavioural issues that persist into adulthood.

Perpetrators

Understanding the motivations behind domestic violence is 
essential to addressing this issue effectively. Perpetrators often 
exhibit common characteristics:

Power and control: The need for control and dominance is a 
driving force behind many abusive relationships. Abusers may 
use physical violence, emotional manipulation, or financial 
coercion to maintain control.

Psychological factors: Some perpetrators have underlying 
psychological issues, such as anger management problems, 
personality disorders, or histories of trauma, that contribute to 
their abusive behaviour.

Consequences

Domestic violence has far-reaching consequences, affecting 
victims, families, and communities: Physical Health: Victims of 
domestic violence may suffer from physical injuries, chronic 
pain, and long-term health issues due to the abuse.

Mental health: Emotional trauma, anxiety, depression, and post-
traumatic stress disorder are common mental health 
consequences for survivors.

Children: Who witness domestic violence often face developmental, 
emotional, and behavioural challenges that can persist into 
adulthood.

Prevention

Preventing domestic violence requires a comprehensive approach 
involving individuals, communities, and institutions:

Education and awareness: Promoting awareness through 
campaigns, workshops, and educational programs can help 
individuals recognize the signs of abuse and seek help.

Legal measures: Strengthening laws against domestic violence 
and ensuring that perpetrators face consequences is crucial. 
Restraining orders and protective measures can provide safety to 
victims.
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Engaging men: Encouraging men to become allies in the fight 
against domestic violence by promoting healthy masculinity and 
intervening when they witness abusive behaviour.

Domestic violence is a complex issue that affects individuals and 
communities on a profound level. It requires a multi-pronged 
approach, including education, legal reform, and support 
services, to address effectively. By understanding its root causes, 
consequences, and prevention strategies, society can work 
towards eradicating this silent epidemic and creating a safer, 
more equitable world for all.
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Support services: Providing accessible and confidential support 
services, including shelters, counselling, and helplines, is 
essential for victims seeking to escape abusive situations.

Eradicating domestic violence

Addressing domestic violence necessitates a collective effort:

Changing cultural norms: Challenging and changing deeply 
ingrained cultural norms that perpetuate gender inequality and 
power imbalances is crucial.

Supporting survivors: Empowering survivors to rebuild their 
lives, regain their self-esteem, and break the cycle of abuse is vital.
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