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EuroSciCon is carrying out 13th Edition of 
International Conference on Microbiology, 
Antibiotics and Public Health, August 25-26, 2021 
in Brussels, Belgium with subject matter of “Magic 
Bullets Targeting Deadly Microbes and Improving 
World Health”. The principle objective of 
Microbiology 2021 is to deliver the brand new 
research factors. 
 
Press Release of Microbiology 2021: 
EuroSciCon organizes the 13th Edition of 
International Conference on Microbiology, 
Antibiotics and Public Health (Microbiology 2021) 
which focuses the current improvements, researches 
and traits within the Microbiology. Microbiology 
2021 points to many attractive scientific classes 
which relates to the sector of Microbiology. 
Microbiology 2021 could be prepared with the topic 
“Magic Bullets Targeting Deadly Microbes and 
Improving World Health” on August 25-26, 2021 | 
Brussels, Belgium. 
 
The conference especially makes a speciality of the 
current advancements in Microbiology and its 
branches, Advances in Applied Microbiology, 
Advances in Microbiology, Microbial Biotechnology, 
Microbial Diversity, Discovery of Antibiotics 
Applications of Microbes, Bioremediation and 
Biodegradation, Public Health & Epidemiology, 
Drug Discovery Technologies in Antibiotics, 
Biotechnology, Environmental Microbiology and 
lots of more. 
 
The convention attendees & members will get 
captivated with brilliant activities and the specialists 
in numerous subjects and get a risk to select up 
records in regard to the momentum check out. It 
gives level to Scientists, PhD pupils, searching for 
after alumni and understudy's representatives from 
the sphere of Microbiology to enhance their abilities 
in every aspect of Microbiology 2021. 
 
Microbiology 2021 will offer a possibility to young 
researchers thru the projects like younger research 
discussion board, Poster Presentation and medical 
meetings. 

 
All Submitted papers in Microbiology 2021 will be 
published in Journal of Immunology & 
Microbiology Journals regarding the topic with 
precise DOI furnished via Crossref.  
 
Microbiology 2021 Highlights:  
Highlights of the conference are Microbiology and 
its branches, Advances in Applied Microbiology, 
Advances in Microbiology, Microbial Biotechnology, 
Microbial Diversity, Discovery of Antibiotics 
Applications of Microbes, Bioremediation and 
Biodegradation, Public Health & Epidemiology, 
Drug Discovery Technologies in Antibiotics, 
Biotechnology, and Environmental Microbiology. 
 
Top Associations and Societies of Harvard 
University, University in New York City, The 
University of Texas , Molecular Genetics 
Conferences, University of California | University 
School of Medicine, University of the Pacific,  
Vaccines Conferences, The University of 
Washington. 
 
Opportunities for Conference Attendees for 
Researchers & Faculty are Speaker Presentations, 
Poster Display, Symposium hosting, Workshop 
organizing 
 
For Universities, Associations & Societies are 
Association Partnering, Collaboration proposals, 
Academic Partnering, Group Participation 
 
For Students & Research Scholars are Poster 
Competition (Winner will get Best Poster Award), 
Young Researcher Forum (YRF Award to the best 
presenter), Student Attendee, Group Registrations. 
 
For Business Delegates we required Speaker 
Presentations, Audience participation, Symposium 
hosting, Book Launch event, Networking 
opportunities. Companies related to Clinical 
Microbiology Exhibitor and Vendor Booths, 
Sponsorships opportunities, Product launch, 
Workshop organizing, Scientific Partnering, 
Marketing and Networking with clients. 
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Microbiology 2021 conferences had many lectures, 
Keynote lectures and a brief note by eminent 
personalities from round the world and have poster 
presentations and oral presentations. During this 
year’s Conference, we tend to hope that you simply 
can seize the prospect to rekindle in-progress 
connections and spark a replacement one alongside 
your colleagues from around the globe. With 
members from round the world centred on learning 
regarding Microbiology and its diseases, this is often 
often your single best chance to realize the most 
important assemblage of participants from the 
scientific community. 
 
Microbiology research has been, and keeps on being, 
critical to address a large number of the chronicled 
and momentum worldwide difficulties, for example, 
looking after food, water and energy security for a 
solid populace on a tenable earth. Applying the key 
microbial information has prompted the 
improvement various clinical, veterinary, modern, 
natural and other biotechnology applications that 
advantage humanity.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Microbiology, investigation of microorganisms, or 
organisms, a different gathering of commonly 
minute basic life-frames that incorporate 
microscopic organisms, archaea, green growth, 
parasites, protozoa, and infections. The field is 
worried about the design, capacity, and 
characterization of such living beings and with 
methods of both misusing and controlling their 
exercises. 
 
To the honourable authors are kindly encouraged to 
contribute to and help shape the conference 
through submissions of their research abstracts, 
papers and e-posters altogether areas of 
Microbiology are cordially invited for presentation 
at the conference. 
 
Regards, 
Elena Gilbert | Program Manager 
Microbiology 2021 
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