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Pott's disease poses a real public health problem in Algeria 
both in terms of its frequency and its severity. The aim of 

our work is to evaluate the effectiveness of surgery by the 
posterior approach alone in the management of tuberculous 
spondylodiscitis at the stage of complications.

Our descriptive and retrospective study concerns 41 cases 
of dorsolumbar Pott's disease, operated in the orthopedic 
surgery department "B" at Douéra university hospital center, 
between January 2011 and July 2021. All patients received 
a single posterior surgery combining decompression, 
stabilization and posterolateral grafting.

The average age of the patients was 41 years, with a clear 
female predominance (63.2%). 

The neurological deficit was present in 73% of cases but of 
different severity. The localization was dorsal in 21 cases, 
dorsolumbar in 14 cases, and lumbar in 6 cases. All patients 
had spinal instability, 65% of which had kyphosis deformity. 
Half of the patients did not have bacteriological evidence at 

the time of the intervention.

Posterior arthrodesis alone was performed in all patients, 
associated with neurological decompression in 75%. Of the 30 
cases with neurological disorders 18 patients recovered. 80% 
of the deformations have been improved. Bone fusion was 
obtained in 92% of patients, no revision surgery was noted.

Tuberculosis chemotherapy combined with single posterior 
approach surgery was effective in the management of 
tuberculous spondylodiscitis, because it allowed, on its own, 
to control the infection, to correct the spinal statics and also 
to improve the neurological status of these patients.
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