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ABSTRACT
Impacted Central Incisor tooth is a common finding in the Orthodontic practice. But managing
of Impacted Incisor which is unfavorable with Dilaceration is a tough task. We are presenting
a case of Maxillary impacted incisor with Dilaceration.
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INTRODUCTION

There is a swing in the decision of surgical
management of impacted teeth from oral surgeon to
Orthodontist. Impaction of a permanent tooth is
rarely diagnosed during the mixed dentition period.
An impacted central incisor is usually diagnosed
when there is delay in the eruption of the tooth.1

Many patients with impacted maxillary central
incisors are referred to orthodontists by General
Practitioners or Pediatric dentists, because Parents
are concerned about the impaction of an incisor in
the early mixed dentition, the impaction of maxillary
central incisors is not very common.2–4 Tooth
impaction may result from a number of local causes
such as supernumerary teeth5-7, odontome, ectopic
position of tooth bud, dilacerations and arrested root
development. Maxillary central incisor impacted at
the apical third of the contra lateral incisor root,
should be managed by the surgical-orthodontic
approach, as spontaneous eruption is unlikely.8

Careful planning is required when moving an
impacted tooth by orthodontic treatment. Impacted
teeth can be properly positioned with orthodontic
traction.9–11

Case report
An eleven year old boy reported to the department
of Orthodontics at our institution in September 2007
complaining of pain in the upper anterior region. On
examination when the patient smiled, a single

central incisor was seen which looked like “Dental
Cyclops” (Non Syndromal) (Fig.1).12 On intra oral
examination, 11 was found missing and 12 was
migrated to the place of 11 leaving very minimal
space for the permanent tooth. 21 was also
migrated towards missing 11 region giving the
appearance of Cyclops tooth (Fig.2). On palpation
there was a bulge which was felt in the sulcus of the
maxillary anterior region next to the labial frenum.
There was no history of trauma. An IOPA revealed
an impacted right central incisor. To know the
morphology and position of the impacted tooth,
OPG, Lateral Cephalogram and an occlusal
radiograph were taken (Fig.3). Impacted tooth
appeared like a Bulls Eye in the OPG; Lateral
Cephalogram showed that the impacted incisor was
just behind the anterior nasal spine and Occlusal
radiograph showed dilaceration of the root (Fig.3).

Treatment

Fixed mechanotherapy was started and 0.016
inch round Niti wire was given to align the teeth and
then 0.019X0.025 inch stainless steel rectangular
wire given with open coil spring between 21 and 12
to gain the space for impacted tooth. The impacted
tooth was exposed using Open Eruption Technique
with window.12 Circular section of the overlying
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Fig.1. Extra oral View of the patient Fig. 2. Intra oral View of the patient

Fig.3a. IOPA
Fig.3b.OPG

Fig.3c.Lateral cephalogram

Fig.3d.Occlusal View

Fig.3a- Fig.3d. Radiographs of the patient



Surgical and clinical techniques Annals and Essences of Dentistry

Vol. - II Issue 3 July – Sept. 2010 165

Fig.4. surgical exposure and bonding of the attachment

Fig.5.Traction force
Fig.6.Alignment in progress

Fig.7. CT scan showing the dilaceration of 11

mucosa and the bony covering was surgically
removed. Distoincisal angle of the incisor was
exposed. A Begg bracket was bonded on to the
exposed incisor and was ligated with 0.009 inch
ligature wire for traction. The flap was repositioned
and sutured to gain good length of attached gingiva
(Fig.4). The attachment was ligated to the arch wire
and traction was given to guide the tooth in to the
position (Fig.5). After the tooth was out of the bone,
a sectional Tandem wire using 0.016 Niti wire was
given over the 0.019X0.025 SS rectangular wire to
align the impacted tooth into the arch (Fig.6). Three
dimensional CT scan was taken to localize the
dilaceration of the root so that it does not impinge
on the adjacent teeth while traction was given. 13 CT

images showed distal dilaceration of the root
(Fig.7). After the eruption of incisor into the arch,
finishing with 0.016 inch stainless steel wire is done.
As very light forces were used for the traction, there
was no discoloration and root resorption hence root
canal treatment or apicoectomy was not required
(Fig.8). Post treatment IOPA showed good length of
inter dental bone and root (Fig.9).

Discussion

Orthodontists may generally opt to extract impacted
maxillary incisors with severe dilaceration because
of difficulties in its management. Most patients
probably would choose extraction and replacement
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Fig.8. Post treatment photographs.

by Prosthesis. However, if extraction of the
impacted central incisor and restoration with a
bridge or an implant is planned, orthodontic traction
of that tooth into the proper position should be
performed initially to improve esthetics and to
achieve and maintain an acceptable bone height.1

Though it is longer duration of treatment, it is
beneficial as the growth is not impeded. The
present case did not use the closed-eruption
surgical technique, which elevates a flap and
returns it to the original location after placing an
attachment on the impacted tooth. The oral surgeon
removed a minimum area of buccal mucosa to
locate the tip of the impacted incisor. So that the
repositioned incisor would present an acceptable
gingival contour and attached gingiva.

Fig.9. Posttreatment radiographs.

The time taken to finish the treatment was two years
seven months. Jerusalem Hypothesis could be the
possible etiology for the impaction of incisor12 as the
patient did not give the history of trauma.

CONCLUSION

Surgical exposure and orthodontic management of
a severely dilacerated impacted incisor is a clinical
challenge. Timely intervention with perfect planning
of the case makes the treatment easy with best

results. Results showed good stability with excellent
esthetics.
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